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General Provisions 
Pursuant to the authority granted within Texas Education 
Code § 96.61 enacted by the Legislature of the State of 
Texas, April 27, 1967, in addition to, Sections 51.201 et 
seq., 54.005, 54.505, and 95.21 of Title 3 of the Texas 
Education Code, the governing board of Sam Houston 
State University (SHSU) is authorized to promulgate rules 
and regulations for the safety and welfare of students, 
employees and property. These regulations and 
procedures apply to any person who walks, drives, or 
parks a motor vehicle or bicycle on the campuses of 
SHSU. In addition to university regulations, all of the 
general and criminal laws of the State of Texas are 
declared to be in full force and effect within the areas 
under the jurisdiction of SHSU, and all persons are 
responsible for compliance with these laws. The governing 
board of SHSU is authorized to employ campus police 
personnel for the purpose of carrying out the provisions of 
Texas Education Code § 96.61 and has commissioned 
such officers as peace officers vested with all the powers, 
privileges and immunities of peace officers in the 
performance of their duties. It shall be unlawful for any 
person to trespass upon the grounds of SHSU, or to 
damage or deface any of the buildings, trees, shrubs, 
grasses, flowers, or other property on the grounds. The 
University Police shall be vested with the authority to 
refuse to allow persons having no legitimate business to 
enter upon any property under the control and jurisdiction 
of SHSU and to eject any unauthorized persons from said 
property upon their refusal to leave peaceably upon 
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Traffic 
Every vehicle operator shall comply with these 
regulations, state law and all traffic control devices at all 
times, unless otherwise specifically directed by P&T or 
SHSUPD. State and local laws pertaining to operation of 
motor vehicles, bicycles and pedestrians on public streets 
apply on the campus and streets owned and operated by 
the university. Vehicles are always prohibited from parking 
in reserved spaces without a proper permit, no-parking 
zones, tow-away zones, fire lanes, crosswalks, loading 
zones or 
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Parking 
To operate or benefit from the use of a motor vehicle on 
campus, each member of the SHSU community must 
register their license plate, pay for parking, park in an 
authorized area, and display their license plate to the 
driving aisle. 

All visitors, faculty, staff, students (full or part-time), and 
employees of private contractors or other government 
agencies assigned to SHSU who operate a vehicle on 
university property, regularly or occasionally, are required 
to obtain a parking permit at all times. 

FOLLOW THESE GUIDELINES TO PARK ON CAMPUS: 

Register your license plate. You can register your license 
plate through the parking portal at shsu.edu/park for annual 
permits or through the ParkMobile app for hourly parking.  

No person may register a motor vehicle in his or her name 
which belongs to another student, faculty, or staff 
member.  

By registering a vehicle for issuance or purchase of a 
permit or permission to park, vehicle operators consent to 
SHSU’s use of automated license plate recognition 
technology in accordance with SHSU policy FO-31.2. The 
license plate of a vehicle followed by make, model, color,  
and year, is required for registration and must be kept 
current and up to date by the operator or custodian of the 
vehicle. 

Select your permit.  The various classes of parking 
permits and their eligibility requirements, privileges, and 
limitations are described in the Permits section. Parking in 
a garage requires the appropriate annual permit, payment 
through the ParkMobile app, or an approved event pass.  

Annual permits must be issued to a person and their 
registered vehicle no later than the first day that the 
vehicle is brought on campus. Hourly permits must be 
purchased within minutes of parking in an available space. 

Park in your authorized area. Each parking lot or garage 
shall be defined by appropriate signs and/or painted lines 
(when the parking area is paved). All spaces are 
designated, but not every space has a sign. It is the 
responsibility of the permit holder to park in the authorized 
area. Most lots are authorized for multiple types of 
permits. 

Parking areas are designated by signs and/or color coding 
on a map obtained online at the P&T website at www. 
shsu.edu/parking. These signs and maps indicate the type 
of permit for which the area is reserved. Signs take priority 
over any printed map. In the presence of faded marker 
lines, the predominant marker line always takes priority 
over a faded, unmaintained paint marking. Any conflict in 
designation should be reported to P&T prior to attempting 
to park. 

Certain parking spaces have been designated as hourly 
parking spaces. These spaces are so designated to 
provide short-term parking for business access to the 
SHSU Post Office, student center offices and other 
designated areas. Parking more than the specified time 
limit is prohibited. Citations may be issued for each 
segment of parking overtime. 

Only Park one registered vehicle per annual permit at 
a time. While you can register multiple vehicles in the 
portal or app, you can only park ONE vehicle on campus 
at a time.  

Faculty and staff, whose dependents are students, may 
allow those dependents to register a commonly operated 
motor vehicle for a student parking permit in addition to 
the employee’s parking permit. If the faculty or staff 
member has two motor vehicles registered, and if both 
motor vehicles are on campus at the same time, the motor 
vehicle with the student permit must be parked in the 
designated student parking area and not in either the 
faculty or staff member’s reserved space, zone, or lot or in 
the time limit areas on campus. 

Pay for parking. For students, employees, and retirees, 
annual permits are paid for through the Cashier’s Office. 
Parking charges are applied to your university account on 
the following day from permit selection. Visitors can 
purchase annual permits with a credit or debit card 
through the parking portal. Anyone can purchase hourly or 
daily parking with a credit or debit card through the 
ParkMobile app. The Parking and Transportation Office 
cannot accept payment in person.  

Display your license plate toward the driving aisle.  To 
verify your parking permissions, we use license plate 
recognition equipment and software which requires your 
license plate to be visible to the driving aisle.  

All vehicles must be parked so that the license plate is 
visible from the driving aisle. The license plate must be 
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securely fastened to the exterior side of the vehicle facing 
the driving aisle in a horizontal, upright position of not less 
than 12 inches from the ground. Removable tow hitches 
must be removed and stored when not in use. No covers 
may be placed over the license plate that would inhibit the 
reflectivity of the plate. The alphanumeric characters of 
the license plate must be visible and unobstructed by 
license plate frames or other accessories. 

AVOID THE FOLLOWING: 

Do not lend, sell, or allow unauthorized use of your 
permit. No person shall lend, sell, or otherwise allow 
another person to use their permit, except as specifically 
authorized by these regulations. Misuse of a permit may 
result in confiscation of the permit without refund and a 
restriction on issuing permits for at least one year. 
Persons found in use of a permit in violation of this section 
will be subject to the proper fine, booting, and/or towing of 
their vehicle(s). 

Do not park without a valid parking permit. Annual 
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either render assistance or authorize temporary parking. 
Temporary parking of disabled vehicles shall not exceed 
24 hours and must not create any obstruction or hazard. 

Do not live in your vehicle. No one may inhabit a vehicle 
of any kind (cars, trailers, campers, motor homes, trucks, 
buses, or other vehicles) on the university campus 
(streets, parking lots, garages, and other areas) except as 
approved by Parking and Transportation Administration. 
Violators may be cited for improper habitation/parking and 
the vehicle(s) may be towed from university property. 
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Permits 
A parking permit will be assigned to your registered license 
plate(s) upon selection in the parking portal or payment 
through the ParkMobile app. The Associate Director of 
P&T may issue a parking permit to any person or company 
desiring to park on university property, upon payment of 
the appropriate fee. 

Permits are non-transferable. Ownership of all permits 
remains with the university and is not transferable. 

Permits expire. All permits will have a date of issuance 
and a date of expiration including timed parking and hourly 
pay spaces. Vehicles parked with an expired permit, 
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Once you leave the parking garage your permit is ended, 
no matter how much time you have left on it.  Pricing varies 
by zone and time. Hourly and daily parking transactions 



SHSU Parking Rules & Regulations | 9 

 

  Zone 3 

Remote parking lots to campus buildings, resulting in a 10-
to-20-minute walk. A few Zone 3 lots provide immediate 
access to off-campus administrative locations. 

Price. $92  

Eligibility. Faculty, Staff, Students, and Visitors. 

24 / 7 Access 
Zone 3 

Peak Access (Weekdays 7:30am - 5pm) 
Overflow lot 

Off Peak Access (Weekdays 5:01pm-7:29am, Weekends) 
Zone 1 lots 
Zone 2 lots 

 

  Overflow 
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  Mobility  

Parking in marked handicap spaces in any zone.  

Price. $218  

Eligibility. Anyone that provides proof of a State of Texas 
issued handicap placard or disabled license plate.  

24 / 7 Access  

Handicap spaces in the surface lots of any zone  

Zone 1 lots  

Zone 2 lots  

Zone 3 lots 

  Disabled Veteran 

Parking lots with close access to academic, recreational, 
and administrative buildings at no cost for eligible drivers. 
In adherence to Texas Transportation Code 681.008  

Price. $0  

Eligibility. Veterans who meet eligibility guidelines but do 
not possess a disabled person license plate or a disabled 
parking placard that features the International Symbol of 
Access (ISA).  

Veterans who meet eligibility guidelines and possess a 
disabled person license plate or disabled parking placard 
that features the International Symbol of Access would be 
granted a “Mobility” permit at no charge which would allow 
you additional parking in Handicap spaces in any zone.  

24 / 7 Access  

Zone 1 lots  

Zone 2 lots  

Zone 3 lots 

BUSINESS PERMITS 

Vendors, Contractors, and Affiliates. Arrangements can 
be made with the Director of Parking and Transportation to 
provide parking options to vendors, contractors, and 
affiliates. The cost of the parking arrangements will be 
determined on a case-by-case basis. Any parking 
arrangements made by a department must be approved by 
Public Safety Services. Otherwise, vendors, contractors, 
and affiliates are considered visitors. Visitors must pay for 
hourly or daily parking options.
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considered attached when the vehicle has been hooked 
completely to the tow truck. 

If the vehicle owner or driver appears on the scene after 
the tow truck driver has made a hookup but before the 
vehicle is impounded, the vehicle will not be impounded. 
The vehicle owner or driver is required to pay the tow truck 
driver the hookup fee in lieu of towing.  

When a vehicle is towed, P&T and SHSUPD shall be 
notified. This notification shall include the name and the 
phone number of the towing contractor. DPSS may refuse 
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Permit Annual Fall Only Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb Mar Apr May June July Aug 

Reserved Surface $645 N/A $645 $645 $595 $545 $495 $445 $395 $345 $295 $245 $195 $145 $95 

Zone 1 $262 $158 $262 $262 $242 $222 $202 $182 $162 $142 $122 $102 $82 $62 $42 
Osteopathic $262 $158 $262 $262 $242 $222 $202 $182 $162 $142 
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Enforcement 
GOVERNANCE 
Office of Parking and Transportation (P&T). This office 
is responsible for all administrative functions relating to the 
issuance of parking permits/permissions, the collection of 
administrative enforcement charges for university parking 
and traffic administrative violations, the acceptance of 
appeals from such violations, the processing of refund 
requests upon withdrawal from the university, and for the 
operation of all parking lots and garages. P&T also 
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• A son, daughter, spouse, or ward of the registered 
owner is such person who is employed with or enrolled 
in the university at the time of the violation.   

• The absence of sufficient parking spaces on the 
university campus is not justification for violation of 
these regulations. Failure to enforce any regulation shall 
not constitute a waiver of the university’s authority to 
enforce these regulations. Other improperly parked 
vehicles do not constitute an excuse for improper 
parking. 

Collection Methods. Failure to pay debts within the 
required time frame can result in the university  
arranging for the collection of fees assessed against 
faculty, staff, students, and visitors in the following manner:    

• Parking citation debts will be invoiced to the permit 
holder, registered owner of the vehicle or the 
individual’s university affiliate that are responsible for 
the citation.   

• A financial or non-financial bar will be placed against 
students for past due debts.   

• SHSU may elect to use the services of a commercial 
collection agency or attorney to collect outstanding 
fees for permits and citations. If a debt is referred to an 
agency or attorney, the offender will be responsible for 
paying all costs of collection, including any agency fees 
and/or reasonable attorney fees, which will be added to 
the total amount due. Additionally, a late fee may be 
added to the outstanding fees.   

• No parking permit or 
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